FINANCE COMMITTEE AGENDA

September 22, 2009

The Finance Committee of the Board of Directors of the Cook County Health and Hospitals System will meet on
Tuesday, September 29, 2009 at the hour of 10:00 A.M. at John H. Stroger, Jr. Hospital of Cook County, 1901
W. Harrison Street, in the fifth floor conference room, Chicago, Illinois, to consider the following:

l. Attendance/Call to Order

Il.  Public Speakers

I1l. Recommendations, Discussion/Information Items

A. Minutes of the Finance Committee Meeting, September 4, 2009
B. Follow-up items:
Great Lakes Medicaid, Inc.
MedAssets
C. Presentation of Year-to-Date Financials through June 2009
D. Update on FY2010 Budget

IVV. Action Items

A. Contracts and Procurement Items (see attached)
B. Any items listed under Section I11

V. Adjourn

Committee Members:
Chairman:  Carvalho
Members:  Board Chairman Batts (Ex-Officio) and
Directors Golden, Mufioz, O’Donnell and Ramirez

Time/Presenter

(times are approximate)
10:00/Chairman Carvalho

10:00-10:10

10:10-10:15/Chairman Carvalho
10:15-10:35/Michael Ayres
10:15-10:25

10: 25-10:35
10:35-10:50/Dorothy Loving
10:50-11:00/Pitt Calkin and
Michael Ayres

11:00-11:15/Leslie Duffy




COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Item IV(A)
SEPTEMBER 29, 2009 - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT ITEMS
Request Affiliate / | Begins on
# Vendor Service or Product Fiscal Impact System Page #
Grant-related item
Budget Amount:
$4,134,801.00
Estimated fiscal
impact:
1 *see item Local Health Protection budget $1,624,517.00 DPH 3
Grant Award
To provide vaccination planning for public
health-organized clinics and administer Grant Award
Illinois Department of vaccine for HIN1 influenza in suburban Cook Amount:
2 Public Health County $2,411,932.00 DPH 5
Grant Renewals
Grant Renewal
Illinois Department of For Bioterrorism & Emergency Preparedness Amount:
3 Public Health Response $1,477,131.00 DPH 6
For a program which will provide breast Grant Renewal
Illinois Department of and/or cervical cancer screening to eligible Amount:
4 Public Health wormen in suburban Cook County $523,430.00 DPH 7
Grant Renewal
Illinois Department of To participate in the Cities Readiness Initiative Amount:
5 Public Health (CRI) in Illinois $317,270.00 DPH 8
Great Lakes Hemophilia
Foundation from the For comprehensive diagnostic care and Grant Renewal
Centers for Disease Control |[treatment to persons with hemophilia and Amount:
6 and Prevention (CDC) other related blood clotting disorders $29,790.00 DPH 9
Cooperative Educational Master Agreement
Program Addendum for post graduate
residents for clinical services in Orthopedic
7 Midwestern University Surgery $134,000.00] SHCC 10
Amend previously approved request to enter into and execute contract
For the provision of anesthesia critical care
8 Draeger Medical Inc. patient monitors $1,060,833.00( SHCC 11
Amend contract
For the provision of pharmacy mail order
prescription and overflow non-mailed
prescription services (amend to include the
packing, unpacking and re-stocking of HIN1 System /
9 SavRx vaccination supply kits for the CCDPH). No fiscal impact DPH 12
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Item IV(A)
SEPTEMBER 29, 2009 - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT ITEMS
Request Begins on
# Vendor Service or Product Fiscal Impact Entity Page #
Increase contracts
For maintenance and enhancement services
10 |Cerner Corporation for Cerner Clinical Information Systems $337,661.00( System 14
For the purchase of institutional
11 |W.W. Grainger, Inc. maintentance, repair and operations supplies $100,000.00f SHcC 15
Extend contract
12 |Stryker Orthopaedics For the provision of orthopedic implants No fiscal impact| SHCC 16
Increase and extend contracts
Angelica Healthcare
13 |Services Group For the provision of laundry linen services $600,000.00( System 17
14  [Inter Parking, Inc. For parking management services $120,310.00f PHCC 19
Enter into and execute contracts
For the provision of the Sternal Talon closure
15 KLS Martin device $200,000.00 SHCC 20
UIC Department of For the provision of neuropathology
16 |Pathology consulting services with Emmanuel Utset, MD $133,255.00( System 21
Award bid(s) and enter into and execute contract(s)
Northwestern
Pharmaceutical & Supply |For the provision of Shimadzu radiographic
17 |Corporation equipment $2,379,210.00| PHCC 22
*see item - multiple
18 |vendors For the provision of printing of hospital forms $1,262,329.60| System 25
19 |[Tallgrass Systems, Ltd. For the provision of Lexmark toner cartridges $854,516.50( System 32
Corporate Cleaning
20 |Services For the provision of window washing services $133,480.00( System 36
Consumers Packing
21 |Company For the provision of seafood products $121,312.50( System 39
*see item - multiple For the provision of disposable dietary
22 |vendors supplies $108,575.15| System 42
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Cook County Department of Public Health

Cook County Health & Hospitals System
Todd H. Stoger * President Health Sy Board Memb
Cook County Board of Commissioners Dr. David A. Ansell
~ Commissioner Jerry Butler

‘Warren L. Batts * Chairman David N. Carvalho

Cook County Health & Hospitals System Quin R. Golden
Benn Greenspan
Jorge Ramirez ¢ Vice Chairman St. Sheila Lyne

Cook County Health & Hospitels System Dr. Luis R. Mufioz

i Heather E. O’Donnell
William T. Foley ¢+ CEO Andrea L. Zopp
Cook County Health & Hospitals System

1010 Lake Street, Suite 300
Oak Park, Illinois 60301

Telephone (708) 492-2000
August 26, 2009 TDD (708) 492-2002
Stephen A. Martin, Jr., Ph.D., M.P.H.

Honorable Chairman and Members | Chief Operating Officer
Cook County Health & Hospitals System

Transmitting a communication requesting authorization to approve a Local Health Protection budget in the
amount of $4,134,801.00. The budget includes the following:

1. Renewal of the Local Health Protection Grant in the amount of $2,064,994 from the
Illinois Department of Public Health (IDPH). The Local Health Protection Grant will
provide health programs for infectious diseases, food protection, potable water supply,
and private sewage disposal; and the Summer Food Program will provide for the
inspection of designated food service preparation facilities.

2. A cash match in the amount of $1,624,517.00 from the Department of Public Health
(895-818 Account) for the management of grant programs.*

3. Intergovernmental Agreement Revenue in the amount of $375,000.00 generated from
Environmental Health Food Sanitation Inspections for various suburban Cook County
municipalities.

4. The transfer of $70,290.00 from Federal Source AIDS Surveillance Grant:

- Federal Source AIDS Surveillance Grant (980-818) for eighty-five per cent (85%)
of Epidemiologist II.

This grant does not require an application process; the funding is automatically renewed. The
authorization to accept the previous budget was given on October 30, 2008 in the amount of
$4,456,811.00 by the Health and Hospital Systems Board.

Local Health Protection Grant: $2,064,994.00

Cash Match (895-818 Account): $1,624,517.00*

Intergovernmental Agreements $ 375,000.00%* Request #
Federal Source AIDS Surveillance: $ 70,290.00%** 1
Total Program Amount: $4,134,801.00

Estimated Fiscal Impact: $1,624,517.00*-(895-818 Account).
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Grant Funded Amount: $2,510,284.00 -52,064,994.00-Local Health
Protection Grant;

$375,000.00 **-Environmental Inspections;

$70,290.00***-Federal Source AIDS Surveillance
Grant.)

Funding Period: July 1, 2009 through June 30, 2010.

Gl

Stephen A. Martin, Jr., ., M.P.H.
Chief Operating Officer
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Cook County Department of Public Health

Cook County Health & Hospitals System

Todd H. Stroger * President - Health Sy Board Memb
Cook County Board of Commissioners o Dr. David A. Ansell
Lo Commmissioner Jerry Butler
‘Warren L. Batts * Chairnan David N. Carvalho
Cook County Health & Hospitals System Quin R. Golden
Benn Greenspan
Jorge Ramirez * Vice Chairman Sr. Sheila Lyne

Dr. Luis R. Mufioz
Heather E. O’Donnell
Wiltiam T. Foley * CEC Andrea L. Zopp
Cook County Health & Hospitals System

Cook County Health & Hospitals System

1010 Lake Street, Suite 300
Qak Park, Illinois 60301

September 17, 2009 Telephone (708) 492-2000
TDD (708) 492-2002
Honorable Chairman and Members ' Stephen A. Martin, Jr., Ph.D., M.P.H.
Chief Operating Officer

Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Transmitting a communication requesting authorization to accept the following Grant Contract to

provide services in 2009.

GRANTOR: Illinois Department of Public Health

FOR: To provide vaccination planning for public health-organized clinics and administer
vaccine for HIN1 influenza according to the Centers for Disease Control guidelines
in suburban Cook County.
This grant did not require an application process. The federal government has
declared an official public health emergency.

TOTAL GRANT AWARD: $2,411,932.00

ESTIMATED FISCAL IMPACT: NONE

FUNDING PERIOD: July 31, 2009 through July 30, 2010.

Submitt? by, .
Stephed A. Marti ,'I.lr., ;L H

Chief Operating Officer

Request #
2
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' }"Cook County Department of Public Health

Cook County Health & Hospitals System
Todd H. Swager * President Health Sy Board Memb
Cook County Board of Commissioners L Dr. David A. Ansell
i : Commissioner Jerry Butler
David N. Carvalho

‘Warren L. Batts * Chairnan

Cook County Health & Hospitals System Quin R. Golden
Benn Greenspan
Jorge Ramirez * Vice Chairman Sr. Sheila Lyne

Dr. Luis R. Mufioz

; Heather E. O’Donnell
William T. Foley * CEO Andres L. Zopp
Cook County Health & Hospitals Systern

Cook County Health & Hospitals System

1010 Lake Street, Suite 300
Oak Park, [llinois 60301

Telephone (708) 492-2000

September 17, 2009 TDD (708) 492-2002

Stephen A. Martin, Jr., Ph.D., M.P.H.
. Chief O ting Officer
Honorable Chairman and Members el perating Sihee

Cook County Health & Hospitals System

Transmitting a communication requesting authorization to accept the following Grant Renewal to

continue services in 2009.

GRANTOR: Illinois Department of Public Health

FOR: Bioterrorism & Emergency Preparedness Response. The purpose of this grant is to
maintain a suburban Cook County emergency response preparedness plan for
incidents of bioterrorism, infectious disease outbreaks, and other public health
threats and emergencies.
This grant does not require an application process; the funding is automatically
renewed. The authorization to accept the previous budget was given on October 30,

2008 in the amount of $1,487,976.00 by the Cook County Health and Hospitals
System Board.

TOTAL GRANT AWARD: $1,477,131.00
ESTIMATED FISCAL IMPACT: NONE

FUNDING PERIOD: August 1, 2009 through July 31, 2010.

Submi v Request #
d AN 3
Stephen A. Martike Jr., P MPH

Chief Operating Officer
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Cook County Department of Public Health
Cook County Health & Hospitals System

‘Todd H. Swoger ¢ President * Health Sy Board Memb
Cook County Board of Commissioners L Dr. David A. Ansell
Cominissioner Jerry Butler
‘Warren L. Batts * Chairman David N. Carvalho
Cook County Health & Hospitals System Quin R. Golden
) Benn Greenspan
Jorge Ramirez * Vice Chairman Sr. Sheila Lyne

Cook County Health & Hospitals Systern Dr. Luis R. Mufioz

. - Heather E. O’Donnell
William T. Foley * CEO : Andrea L. Zopp
Cook County Health & Hospitals System
1010 Lake Street, Suite 300
Oak Park, Illinois 60301

Telephone (708) 492-2000

August 31, 2009 TDD (708) 492-2002

Stephen A. Martin, Jr., Ph.D., M.P.H.
. Chief Operating Officer
Honorable Chairman and Members

Cook County Health & Hospitals System

Transmitting a communication requesting authorization to accept the following Grant Renewal to
continue services in 2010.

GRANTOR: 1llinois Department of Public Health

FOR: A program which will provide breast and /or cervical cancer screening to eligible
women in suburban Cook County.

This grant does not require an application process; the funding is automatically
renewed. The authorization to accept the previous budget was given on October 30,
2008 in the amount of $534,535.00 by the Cook County Board of Commissioners.

ORIGINAL GRANT AWARD: $174,990.00

GRANT CONTRACT INCREASE: $348,440.00

REVISED GRANT TOTAL: $523,430.00

ESTIMATED FISCAL IMPACT: NONE

FUNDING PERIOD: July 1, 2009 through June 30, 2010
Subrné’ t:g by, Req:est #
Stephen A. Mﬁ Jr.,%‘MPH

Chief Operating Officer
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‘ Cook County Department of Public Health

Cook County Health & Hospitals System
Todd H. Suroger » President Health System Board Members
Cook County Board of Commuissioners . Dr. David A. Ansell
i Commissioner Jerry Butler

‘Warren L. Batts * Chairman David N. Carvalho

Cook County Health & Hospitals System Quin R. Golden
Benn Greenspan
Jorge Ramirez * Vice Chairman Sr. Sheila Lyne

Cook County Health 8 Hospitals Systemn Dr. Luis R. Mufioz

) Heather E. O’Donnell
William T. Foley * CEO Andrea L. Zopp
Cook County Health 8 Hospitals System
1010 Lake Street, Suite 300
Qak Park, Ilhnois 60301

. Telephone (708) 492-2000
September 17, 2009 clepho e 09002

Honorable Chairman and Members ' s""“‘“c‘;:gg:;;g:;‘(’;’f'ﬁ‘:; M.P.H.
Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Transmitting a communication requesting authorization to accept the following Grant Renewal to

continue services in 2009.

GRANTOR: lllinois Department of Public Health

FOR: To participate in the Cities Readiness Initiative (CRI) in Illinois; that is, conduct a
total of at least three (3) different drills that each cover one of these activities: Staff
call-down, site activation, facility set-up, pick-list generation, dispensing and/or
modeling of throughput. CCDPH will plan, conduct, and evaluate at least one full-
scale or functional mass prophylaxis exercise.
This grant does not require an application process; the funding is automatically

renewed. The authorization to accept the previous budget was given on October 30,
2008 in the amount of $301,096.00 by the Cook County Board of Commissioners.

TOTAL GRANT AWARD: $317,270.00
ESTIMATED FISCAL IMPACT: NONE

FUNDING PERIOD: August 1, 2009 through July 31, 2010.

Submitjed by, _ | Request #
VI 5
Sfepheh A. Mart{l} /1., H

Chief Operating Officer

Page 8 of 44





ook County Health & Hospitals System

Todd H. Stroger ¢ President
Cook County Board of Commissioners

Warren L. Batts » Chairman
Cook County Health & Hospitals System
Jorge Ramirez » Vice-Chairman
Cook County Health & Hospitals System

William T. Foiey * CEO
Cook County Health & Hospitals System

Health & Hospitals System Board Members

Dr. David A. Ansell
Commissioner Jerry Butler
David N. Carvalho
Quin R. Golden
Benn Greenspan

1900 West Polk Street, Suite 220 Sr. Sheila Lyne
Chicago, Illinois 60612 Dr. Luis R. Mufioz
Tel: (312) 864-6820 Heather E. O'Donnell
Fax: (312) 864-9994 Andrea L. Zopp

COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Operating Unit:

Description of
Services:

Justification for

This Contract:

Cost of Contract

And Terms:

Budget Info:

Signatures:
Chief Unit CFO

Reqguest for Grant roval

Sept 4, 2009

Lynda Brodsky, MPH
Director, Research Affairs

Great Lakes Hemophilia Foundation, CCHHS

Requesting authorization to renew Centers for Disease Control and
Prevention (CDC) in the amount of $29,790.00 with Great Lakes
Hemophilia Foundation,

This grant provides comprehensive diagnostic care and
treatment to persons with hemophilia and other related

blood clotting disorders. The grant does not require an
application process; the funding is automatically renewed.
CCHHS Board needs to approve this Grant.

Grant Award: $29,790.00
Funding Period: September 30, 2009 thru September 29, 2010

The Budget Department has reviewed this item; and all
requisite documents have been submitted.

‘Request #
6

CCHHS Director of m Ma-f / W

Purchasing

CCHHS CEO

¢ Ambulatory & Community Health Network ¢« Cermak Health Services * Cook County Department of Public Health
e John H. Sh'ogor, Jr, Hospltal + Oak Forest Hosplial * Provident Hosplial * Ruth M. Rothsteln CORE Centor °

We Bring Health CARE to Your Community
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITAL SYSTEM

Contract Item for Board Approval
Enter into and Execute Program Addendum

Date: May 27, 2009
Sponsor: Johnny C. Brown

Chief Operating Officer
Hospital Administration

Operating Unit: John H. Stroger, Jr., Hospital of Cook County

Description of Midwestern University

Services: for the provision of post graduate residents for clinical services.

Justification for We are requesting authorization to enter into and execute the new Program
Addendum for post graduate (PG) residents for clinical services in
Orthopedic Surgery .

This Program Addendum will combine the academic and clinical resources
of the Midwestern University with the educational and training experience
of Stroger Hospital of Cook County.

This agreement supplements and enhances the required clinical services
provided to the hospital‘s patients by subspecialist, we would not otherwise
be able to recruit.

Cost of Contract $134,000.00
And Terms: July 01, 2009 through June 30, 2010 (12 month contract)
Budget Info: Fiscal Impact: $134,000.00

2009-$ 55,834.00

2010- $78,166.00
Account # 897-272
Requisition #

Signatures:

Operating Unit COO

Operating Unit CFO Reqt;est #
CCHHS Director of

Purchasing

CCHHS GO

Page 10 of 44





COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Request to amend previously approved Enter & Execute

Date:

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description of
Services:

Justification for
This Contract:

Cost of Contract
And Terms:

Budget Info:

Signatures:

Operating Unit CFO

CCHHS Director of

Purchasing

CCHHS COO

September 14, 2009

Gennadiy Voronov, M.D.
Chairman, Anesthesia

Department of Anesthesiology & Pain Management, John H.
Stroger, Jr. Hospital of Cook County

Draeger Medical Inc. (Telford, PA 18969) for the provision of
Anesthesia Critical Care Patient Monitors.

Much of Stroger Hospital’s inventory is approaching end-of-life in
terms of usage and age. The request for sole source is based on
compatibility with existing/new equipment, which is all from
Draeger Medical.

This request was approved by the Board of Directors of the
Health and Hospitals System on December 18, 2008 with the
total fiscal impact in the amount of $1,516,476.00. We recently
received updated specifications and pricing. Respectfully
request to amend the previously approved item, to reflect the
correct fiscal impact amount.

Estimated Cost: $1,060,833.00
(One-time purchase)

897 — 540
Requisition No. 88974104

7/

. Request #
- |

4
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Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description of
Service:

Justification:

Cost of the contract
and terms:

Amend Contract for Board Approval

Martin Grant, RPh., Health and Hospitals System Pharmacy
Director

Health and Hospitals System Pharmacy Administration (8900801)

Amend current contract (08-41-145) Pharmacy Mail Order
Prescription & Overflow Non-Mailed Prescription Services to
include the packing, unpacking and restocking of HIN1
vaccination supply kits for the Cook County Department of Public
Health. Vaccination supply kits are needed for the mass
vaccination of approximately 800,000 students at schools
throughout Cook County with the HIN1 influenza vaccine.

The packing of HIN1 vaccination supply kits is crucial to bringing
the HIN1 vaccination program to the Cook County schools. It is
anticipated that vaccine will be distributed to Cook County
sometime in October and that all supplies be ready for the mass
vaccination program. The current Mail Order Pharmacy vendor
SavRx has the experience and personnel needed for the large scale
packing process that is being required in such a relatively short
period of time. It is anticipated that approximately 8,000 supply
kits will need to be packaged for this program anticipated to begin
in October.

$00.00 contract financial impact. The cost per kit handling will be
the same as the current contract cost for the processing of
prescriptions. This cost will also include the packaging containers.

Budget information: Contract 08-41-145. Authorized by Cook County Board on
2/20/2008. Contract period 03/01/08-02/28/2011 for the amount of

$30,680,000.00

Sponsor
Operating Unit CFO

CCHHS Director
of Purchasing

CCHHS COO

Request #
9
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H1N1 Vaccination Program Supply Kit

BOX A = 100 Clients

School/Daycare Clinic Supplies Unit of Measure Kit/Qty4
Alcohol preps medium 2 ply 100/box 2
Alcohol, rubbing, isopropyl 70%, 16 oz/bottle Bottle 1
Bag, infectious waste, red 24 x 24 Each 4
|Bag, infectious waste, red 40 x 46 Each 4
Band-aids, adhesive, latex free, 1 inch x 3 inch 100/box 2
Base/stabilizer for biohazard 2 gallon container Each 2
Biohazard boxes Each 2
Biohazard tape Roll 1
Bleach - 1qt Quart 1
Cotton balls Each 200
Gloves, latex non-sterile, powder-free size large 100/box 2
Gloves, latex non-sterile, powder-free size medium 100/box 2
Gloves, latex non-sterile, powder-free size small 100/box 2
Gloves, non-latex, non-sterile powder-free size large 100/box 1
Gloves, non-latex, non-sterile powder-free size medium 100/box 1
Gloves, non-latex, non-sterile powder-free size small 100/box 1
Insulated lunch bag for vaccinator station Each 2
Lab coats, disposable - white extra large Each 4
Lab coats, disposable - white large Each 4
Lab coats, disposable - white medium Each 4
|Lab coats, disposable - white small o Each 4
Pens - black 12/box 1
| Scissors Each 1
Sharps containers, biohazard 2 gallon (holds approx 120 syringes) Each 2
Spray bottles 24 0z Each 1
Stat rinse antiseptic hand gel (4 - 6 oz/bottle) Bottle 2
Syringes - 3cc, 22g x 1.5 inches Retractable 100/box 2
Syringes - 3cc, 23g x 1 inch Retractable 100/box 2
Table covers Each 4
Tape - masking B Roll 1
Thermometers, disposable (axillary & oral) Each 100
Tissues, facial (5.0 inches x 7.5 inches, 2 ply, 40 per box) Box 6
Towel, c-fold 150/pack 2|
Tray, dosposable carry 6 inches x 8 inches - Each 20
Coolers for Vaccine Transport Each 1
Cold Packs for Coolers Each 2
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITAL SYSTEMS

Date:

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description ofServices:

Justification for this

Contract:

Cost of the Increase
and Terms:

Budget Information:

Signatures:

Sponsor

REQUEST TO INCREASE

Wednesday, September 16, 2009

Steven Zeelau,
Chief Information Officer

Cook County Health and Hospital Systems
Health Information Systems

CERNER CORPORATION, KANSAS CITY, MISSOURI (Contract
No.07-45-363) Maintenance and Enhancement Services for Cerner
Clinical Information Systems.

The request is to increase support for the following:

1. Retain services requested by CNO for Cerner to audit nursing
workflow. Based on results, CNO can define methods of user
improvement and compare CCHHS against Cerner best practices.

2/3. To accommodate additional licenses to support the increased users

utilizing Cerner within CCHHS.

4. To increase memory for the Cemer non production testing and
train domains.

Contract No. 07-45-363
(7/01/09 -6/30/10)

Original Contract Amount (07-45-363): $7,111,261.79
Amount Requested for Increase: $ 337,661.00
Overall Total: $7,448,922.79

Account 890/170

D77 rsi—

CCHHS Director
of Purchasing

CCHHS CEO

V@;‘A&W@ o

wa

= / Request #
10
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

INCREASE DOLLAR AMOUNT OF EXISTING CONTRACT

Date:

Sponsor:

Operating
Unit:
Description
Of Service:

Justification:

Current Cost
And Terms:

Budget
Information:

Signatures:

Sponsor:

CCHHS CFO:

CCHHS Director
Of Procurement:

Bd, Ltr: Increase Grainger

September 16, 2009

Johnny C. Brown, Chief Operating Officer
Stroger Hospital of Cook County

Department of Buildings and Grounds

To increase Contract # 09-41-73 previously approved by the System Board on
February 26, 2009 to participate in the existing State of Illinois Maintenance,
Repair and Operational (M.R.O.) contract with W. W. Grainger, Inc., Palatine,
Illinois for the purchase of institutional maintenance, repair and operations
supplies.

This contract has saved approximately $54,000 in terms of difference between
the catalog and actual price paid for Grainer products. Stroger Hospital would
have paid the catalog price if not joined with the State of Illinois contract for the
first time this year. We estimate that an additional $100,000 is needed to cover
all expected and unforeseen expenses for maintenance equipment and supplies
to be purchased in the next few months. Year end expense data will reveal a
more realistic usage of this contract and better prepare us for FY 2010
projections.

Estimated fiscal impact: $100,000.00

Original Award Amount: $300,000.00
This Request: $100.000.00
Adjusted Amount: $400,000.00

Account #: 897-333

Contract Period: March 1, 2009 through November 30, 2009.

\L@T“ A/ Jog

. 17rown\é .0.0., Stroger Hospital of Cook County

Request #

7/ z Y
M%t‘ﬂ 1 Po—

Leslie Duffy, Director/of Procurement, C.C.H.H.S.
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITAL SYSTEM

Contract Extension
Date: September 2, 2009
Sponsor: Johnny C. Brown

Chief Operating Officer
Hospital Administration

Operating Unit: Department of Surgery, Cook County Health & Hospital Systems

Justification for To allow sufficient time to negotiate the best pricing for the new
This Contract: contract. The 90 day extension will also enable the department to

fully use the previously approved funds.

Cost of Contract:  The original contract number is 08-41-346 Stryker Orthopaedics
' was approved by the Cook County Health and Hospital Board on
10/3/08 in the amount of 3,260,816.00 for 12 months. 09/01/08
through 08/31/09.

Budget Info: This extension is for time only and will result in no fiscal impact.
There are sufficient funds remaining in the original board approved
- contract to cover this extension request.
Budget A/C: 531210,897

Signatures:

Operating Unit CFO

JSH COO C%—” /16109
CCHHS Director >€L"L~‘- @&{‘Qj / WU\

of Purchasing M
CCHHS CHO MQ

Request #
12
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Date:

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description of
Services:

Justification for
This Contract:

Cost of Contract
And Terms:

Extend & Increase

August 31, 2009

Leslie Duffy, R.N., M.B.A.
Senior Director Supply Chain Management

Cook County Health and Hospitals System
John H. Stroger, Jr., Provident, and Oak Forest Hospitals and
Cermak Health Services

Requesting approval to extend and increase contract 04-53-481 with
Angelica Healthcare Services Group, Chicago, IL for the provisior of
Laundry Linen Services for John H. Stroger, Jr. Hospital of Cook County
Hospital of Cook County, Provident Hospital of Cook County, Oak Forest
Hospital of Cook County, and Cermak Health Services for Cook County.

The specifications for the first bid opening for the new contract was for a
four (4) year period. We requested to cancel and re-bid the contract to
revise the specifications to reflect a two (2) year contract, it inadvertently
was re-bid again as a four year contract. This extension and increase will
allow continued services until negotiations can be completed.

Original contract awarded in the amount of $13,701,818.59 for the period
of November 1, 2004 through October 31, 2008 approved by the Cook
County Board on June 15, 2004.

First extension for the period of November 1, 2008 through January 31,
2009 was approved by the Cook County Health and Hospitals System
Board on October 31, 2008.

Second extension for the period of Februaryl, 2009 through May 31, 2009
and increase in the amount of $1,403,760.58 was approved by the Cook
County Health and Hospitals System Board on January 15, 2009.

Third extension for the period of June 1, 2009 through September 30,
2009 and increase in the amount of $240,000.00 was approved by the
County Health and Hospitals System Board on June 4, 2009.

This extension requested is for the period of October 1, 2009 through
March 31, 2009.

Request #
13
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Budget Info:

Signatures:

CCHHS CFO

CCHHS Director of
Purchasing

CCHHS COO

This increase amount requested: $600,000.00
CHS: Acct. 240 — 220 $0.00

JHS: Acct. 897 -222 $600,000.00
OFH: Acct. 898 —222 $0.00

PH: Acct. 891 - 222 $0.00
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Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Reqguest to Extend and Increase Contract

Date: August 25, 2009
Sponsor: Sidney A. Thomas

Chief Operating Officer

Operating Unit: Provident Hospital of Cook County

Description of

Service: I am requesting to extend CC 06-53-164R from 9/1/09 thru
11/30/09 and increase by $120,310.00 for parking management
services with Inter Parking, Inc., Chicago, IL.

Justification for

this contract: This extension and increase will allow time for the bid, award and
implementation of a new contract which was approved by the
CCHHS Board to advertise for bids on 8/12/09.

Cost of the contract
and terms: This original contract was Cook County Board approved on
8/14/06 in the amount of $1,443,714.76 for a three year period.

Budget information: Increase requested: $120,310.00
Account: 8§91-260

Signatures:

éponsor gﬁvm A %\4‘7
CCHHS CFO m‘é‘;

CCHHS Director
of Purchasing
CCHHS COO Reqf:“ #
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITAL SYSTEM

Date:

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description of
Services:

Justification for

Cost of Contract
And Terms:

Budget Info:

Signatures:

Sponsor

Operating Unit CFO

JSH' COO

CCHHS Director of

Purchasing

CCHHS CO0

1ofl

Enter into and Execute Contract

Friday, June 19, 2009

Johnny Brown, COO
John Stroger Hospital

Cook County Health & Hospitals System

The contract with KLS Martin
Mentor Ohio,, is for the provision the Sternal Talon Sternal closure
device.

The device provides substantial sternal closure in patients at high
risk for dehiscence/ mediastinitis, per the cardiothoracic chair
“virtually abolishing the risk of this complication”. The devices
seem to result in less discomfort with the sternotomy and facilitate
prompt discharge. Although the device provides substantial sternal
closure it does not pose an obstacle to emergent re-entry.

$200,000 9/1/09 through 8/31/2010

Fiscal Impact $200, 000.00
FY 2009 $ 50,000.00
FY 2010 $150,000.00
Budget A/C: 531210, 897

i

A0 N )

Request #
15
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Date:

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description of

Services

Justification for

This Contract:

Cost of Contract
And Terms:

Budget Info:

Signatures:

Request to Enter & Execute

September 15, 2009

Joanne Dulski
System-Wide Administrative
Director of Laboratories

Depértment of Pathology, CCHHS

UIC Department of Pathology (Chicago, IL 60612) for the
provision of Neuropathology Consulting Services with
Emmanuel Utset, M.D.

This agreement will provide for a prime attending in Neuropathology
for SHCC Pathology and his/her backup. Patients requiring
Neuropathology Services at Stroger Hospital of Cook County will

be covered under this program. Resident and other education will
also be covered by this program. Currently, the Department does

not have the personnel with the experience and expertise in
Neuropathology.

Contract Period: 12/1/09 through 11/30/2010

Fiscal Impact: $133,255.00
Budget Account: 897/155

7 7
Operating Unit CF O‘ﬂ)ﬁ@&— Request #
16

CCHHS Director
Purchasing

CCHHS COO

. \»f‘%%_
g
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Date:

Sponsor:

Operating Unit:

Description:

Justification:

Cost and Terms:

Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Budget Info:

Signatures:

Sponsor

CCHHS CFO

CCHHS Director of

Purchasing

CCHHS COO

Request to Award and Execute Contract

September 14, 2009

Sidney A. Thomas
Chief Operating Officer

Provident Hospital of Cook County

Requesting to award and execute contract 09-72-91 to
Northwestern Pharmaceutical & Supply Corporation,
Lincolnwood, IL. for the provision of Shimadzu Radiographic
Equipment.

A request for bids was initiated and opened on 5/20/09 in which
Northwestern Pharmaceutical & Supply Corporation was the
lowest bidder responding meeting specifications and was
responsive to the MBE/WBE requirements.

This is a One Time Purchase contract in the amount of
$2,379,210.00.

Capital 717 / 891 — 540 Account

Aw(/ﬁq? B e

Mb«f@;/m’*

Request #
17
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THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

EARLEAN GOLLING
ANRERT STEELE

JERRY BUTLER
Wil,LIAM M. BEAVERS
DEBORAH 3IM5

INAN PATAICIA MURPHY
JDSEPIt MARIY MOREND
ROBERTG MALDONARD

COOK COUNTY

TODD H. STROGER OFFICE OF CONTRACT COMPLIANCE
\ D:HES;DF-“: - , BETTY HANGCOCK PERRY
8Dl PETER N, SILVESTRI th Dist.
aml Bist,  BRIDEY GAINER 10th Olsr. DIRECTOR
O DL JOHN P, OALE Dist.
A;n m:f‘ FORAEST CLA;’PUOL :;:: Dl:!. 118 North Clark Street, Room 1020
g:: g::;;_ ;:gz Z%gnsmn 13 n:st. Chiepgo, |llinoiz 606021304
ph. ™ 141 Dis), :
3 i TEL (312} 603-5502
nh oK,  TIMOMY 0, SCHNEIDER 15th Ol ‘
IO ANTHONY o PERAILE e i, : : FAX (312) 6D3-4547

ELIZABETH 4w DOODY GCAMAR  17th Dist.

September 3, 2009

Ms. Leslie Duffy .1
Senior Director , |
Supply Chain Management
1900 West Polk Street, Suite 220 !
Chicago, IL 60612

Re:  Contract No. 09-72-91

9G :{{HY 4~ 43S 6002

Dear Ms. Duffy:

The following bid for the above referenced contrsict has been reviewed for cornplmnce
with the General Conditions regarding the Mmon ty and Women Owned Business
Enterprises Ordinance and has bzen found to be responqwe to the Ordinance:

Bidder: Northwestum Pharmaceutical & Supply Corporanon
Bid Amount: $2,377,210.00

f
;

M\WBE " Status | Dollar Arfount %
CBL Services MBE-6 = $594,800.50(D)  25%

Trako Dental & Medical Supply, Inc WBE-7 ; $237,921.00(D) 10%

The Office of Contract Comipliarice has been advxsed that no other bidders are being
recommended for award. ,

Sincerely, .

Betty Hancock Perry
Contract Complianc: Administraior
BHP/hrtj ; i

GB Printed 0 Revyeled |‘np§r
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TABULATION OF BIDS OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

RADIOGRAPHIC EQUIPMENT, SHIMADZU
FOR
PROVIDENT HOSPITAL OF COOK COUNTY

CONTRACT NO: 09-72-91

REQUISITION NO. 78910587 BID OPENING DATE: 05/20/09
BIDDER: NORTHWESTERN MIKRON DIGITAL ALLIANCE
PHARMACEUTICAL & TMAGING MIDWEST, HEALTH
SUPPLY INC. SERVICES, INC.
CORPORATION
BASE BID: $2,379,210.00 $2,499,960.00 $2,513,186.00
ALTERNATE BID: $2,592,746.00
EST. $§ AMOUNT:5850,000.00 JL 0303/3s
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Cook County Health and Hospitals System
Finance Committee
Contract Item for Board Approval,
Request to Award Bid, and Request to Enter Into and Execute Contract

Sponsor: Leslie Duffy, Director of Procurement, CCHHS

Operating Unit: Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Description of Service:

Authorization is requested to enter into contract with the following lowest qualified
bidders meeting specifications for the provision of Printing, Hospital Forms. Contract
Number 09-15-110H.

Justification for this contract:*

The following vendors are the lowest qualified bidders meeting specifications, and were
found to be responsive to the Minority and Women Owned Business Enterprises
Ordinance as determined by the Contract Compliance Administrator:

e Paper Solutions: Section | Items 1A thru 336A, Section Il Items 337A thru 382A,
Section lil Items 383A thru 496A, Section IV ltems 497A thru 550A, Section V
Iltems 551A thru 867A, and Section VIl Items 877A thru 881A.

¢ Unlimited Graphix: Section VI Items 868A thru 876A.
Cost of the contract and terms:

This is a 12 month contract to commence upon Board Award. The total anticipated cost
of this contract is $ 1,262,329.60.

Paper Solutions $ 962,680.10
Unlimited Graphix $ 299,649.50

Total $1,262,329.60

Budget information: The cost for this contract has been committed for the current
operating budget of 2009 and future year funds for Printed Forms 240/891/897/898-240.

* Contained in the backup materials are justifications to award bids, and
request to enter into and execute contracts.

Request #
18
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Signatures:

Sponsor

CCHHS CFO

CCHHS COO

)

Anthony Tedeschi, M.D. Interim COO, CCHHS
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The following bidder did not meet specifications. Justification provided:

The apparent lowest bidder did not meet specifications for the following item therefore
request award to Paper Solutions.

» Sections |, IV, V: In that Paper Solutions bid for recycled paper is less than 10%
higher than the lowest responsible bid as offered by Paper Solutions for virgin
paper, Paper Solutions recycled paper bid shall be considered the low bid as per
the Cook County Recycling Ordinance. MPE Business Forms, Inc. (Recycled
Paper) and Shamrock Labeling System (Virgin & Recycled Paper) submitted a
partial bid not a complete bid as specified for these sections.

e Section II, lll: In that Paper Solutions bid for recycled paper is less than 10%
higher than the lowest responsible bid as offered by Paper Solutions for virgin
paper, Paper Solutions recycled paper bid shall be considered the low bid as per
the Cook County Recycling Ordinance. MPE Business Forms, Inc. (Recycled
Paper) submitted a partial bid not a complete bid as specified for these sections.

¢ Section VII: In that Paper Solutions bid for recycled paper is less than 10%
higher than the lowest responsible bid as offered by Paper Solutions for virgin
paper, Paper Solutions recycled paper bid shall be considered the low bid as per
the Cook County Recycling Ordinance. Shamrock Labeling System (Virgin &
Recycled Paper) submitted a partial bid not a complete bid as specified for this
section.

The apparent lowest bidder did not meet specifications for the following item therefore
request award to Unlimited Graphix.

e Section VI: In that Unlimited Graphix bid for recycled paper is less than 10%
higher than the lowest responsible bid as offered by Unlimited Graphix for virgin
paper, Unlimited Graphix recycled paper bid shall be considered the low bid as
per the Cook County Recycling Ordinance.
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TABULATION OF BIDS

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASAING AGENT
COUNTY OF COOK

PRINTING, HOSPITAL FORMS

COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SERVICE

FOR

CONTRACT NUMBER: 09-15-110H BID OPENING 7/15/09
SECTION I
SHAMROCK
MPE BUSINESS PAPER LABELING
BIDDER: FORMS, INC. SOLUTIONS SYSTEMS
IRGIN BID $618,329.45 $437,153.70
RECYCLED BID $633,282.95 *$437,153.70
PARTIAL BID $7,444.50

NOTE: The figure read aloud at the bid opening for Paper Solutions Recycled was: $437,086.50. A
review of the arithmetic and extension of unit prices reflects a bid of: $437,153.70.

SECTION I1
MPE BUSINESS PAPER
BIDDER: FORMS, INC. SOLUTIONS
VIRGIN BID $136,191450 $104,655.50
RECYCLED BID $138,189.50 *$104,655.50
SECTION III
MPE BUSINESS PAPER
BIDDER: FORMS, INC. SOLUTIONS
VIRGIN BID $98,285.10 $85,793.50
RECYCLED BID $101,261.75 *$85,793.50

NOTE: The figure read aloud at the bid opening for Paper Solutions Recycled was $85,837.50. A review

of the arithmetic and extension of unit prices reflects a bid of $85,793.50.

*Lowest Qualified Bidder Meeting Specifications
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09-15-110H

SECTION IV
SHAMROCK
MPE BUSINESS PAPER LABELING
BIDDER: FORMS, INC. SOLUTIONS SYSTEMS
IRGIN BID $171,083.40 $135,659.90
RECYCLED BID $171,836.75 *$135,659.90
PARTIAL BID $23,711.90
SECTION V
SHAMROCK
MPE BUSINESS PAPER LABELING
BIDDER: FORMS, INC. SOLUTIONS SYSTEMS
VIRGIN BID $481,393.46 $194,402.50
RECYCLED BID $483,466.26 *$194,402.50
PARTIAL BID $26,624.00

NOTE: The figure read aloud at the bid opening for Paper Solutions Recycled was $192,167.50.
A review of the arithmetic and extension of unit prices reflects a bid of $194,402.50.

SECTION VI
SHAMROCK
PAPER LABELING UNLIMITED
BIDDER: SOLUTIONS SYSTEMS GRAPHIX
VIRGIN BID $348,408.00 $470,289.50 $299,649.50
RECYCLED BID $457,364.00 $470,289.50 *$299,649.50
PARTIAL BID

*Lowest Qualified Bidder Meeting Specifications
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09-15-110H

SECTION VII
SHAMROCK
G FALL PAPER LABELING
BIDDER: PRINTING SOLUTIONS SYSTEMS
VIRGIN BID $10,748.00 $5,015.00
RECYCLED BID *$5,015.00
PARTIAL BID $200.90

*Lowest Qualified Bidder Meeting Specifications
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THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

v

EARLEAN COLLINS
ROBCT STEELE

JERRY BUTLER
WILLIAM M. BEAVERS
DEBORAH SIMS

JOAN PATRICIA MURPHY
JOSEPH MARIO MORENQ
ROBERTQ MALDONADO

COOK COUNTY
TODD H. STROGER OFFICE OF CONTRACT COMPLIANCE

PRESIDENT

BETTY HANCOCK PERRY
1st Dist.  PETER N. SILVESTRI 9th Dist. DIRECTOR
2nd Disl.  BRIDGET GAINER 10th Dist.
3rd Dist.  JOHN P. DALEY 11th Dist.
4thDist.  FORREST CLAYPOOL 12th Dist, 118 North Clark Street, Room 1020
St Dist.  LARRY SUFFREDIN 13th Dist. Chicagpo, Hlinois 60602-1304
§th Dist.  GREGG BOSLIN 14th Dist. )
HhDist.  TIMOTHY O. SCHNEIDER 15th Dist. TEL (312) 603-5502
8ihDist.  ANTHONY J. PERAICA 16th Dist. FAX (312) 603-4547

ELIZABETH ANN DOODY GORMAN  17th Dist.

August 20, 2009

Ms. Leslie Duffy

Senior Director

Supply Chain Management

1900 West Polk Street, Suite 220
Chicago, IL 60612

Re: Contract No. 09-15-110H

Dear Ms. Duffy:

The following bids for the above referenced contract have been reviewed for compliance with the General
Conditions regarding the Minority and Women Owned Business Enterprises Ordinance and have been

found to be responsive to the Ordinance:

Bidder: Paper Solutions
Bid Amount: $962,680.10

M\WBE Status Dollar Amount %
Bren Products Co MBE-6 $240,670.03(D)~ 25%
Beacon Printers - WBE-7 $ 96,268.01(D) 10%

Bidder: Unlimited Graphix
Bid Amount: $299,649.50

MWBE Status Dollar Amount %
Bren Products Co MBE-6 $74,912.38(D) 25%
Integrated Label Corporation WBE-7 $29,964.95(D) 10%

The Office of Contract Compliance has been advised that no other bidders are being recommended for
award.

Sincerely,

Betty Mancock Perry :

Contract Compliance Administrator
BHP/hrij

61 :8 WY G2 9NV 6002

RN 51

INTWNLEVA3E0 BNISVRIENS
e 1] [
1Y =i A it
A O3A02Y
@ Printed on Recycled Paper
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM
Request to Award & Execute

Date: September 11, 2009
Sponsor: Leslie Duffy, R.N.,, M.B.A.

Director Supply Chain Management

Operating Unit: CCHHS

Description of Tallgrass Systems, Ltd.(Orland, IL 60462) for the provision of
Services: cartridges, toner, Lexmark.

Justification for A request for bids was initiated and Tallgrass Systems, Ltd. was
This Contract: chosen by virtue of them being the lowest bidder meeting all

specifications and being responsive to the MBE/WBE ordinance.

Cost of Contract (Contract No. 09-72-93) This is a 24 month contract in the amount
And Terms: of $854,516.50 to commence upon award, execution and implementation
of the contract. :

Budget Info: 890-361

Signatures:

Operating Unit CFO

CCHHS Director @ﬁ;‘.
Purchasing

CCHHS COO

Request #
19

Page 32 of 44





THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

EARLEAN COLLINS
ROBERT STEELE

JERRY BUTLER

WILLIAM M. BEAVERS
DEBORAH SIMS

JOAN PATRICIA MURPRY
JOSEPH MARIO MORENO
ROBERTO MALDONADO

COOK COUNTY
TODD H. STROGER OFFICE OF CONTRACT COMPLIANCE

PRESIDENT

BETTY HANCOCK PERRY
istDist.  PETER N. SILVESTRI 51 Dist. DIRECTOR
2nd Dist.  BRIDGET GAINER 10th Dist.
3rd Dist.  JOHN P. DALEY 11th Dist.
4N Dist,  FORREST CLAYPOOL 12th Dist. 118 North Clark Street, Room 1020
5th Dist.  LARRY SUFFREDIN 13th Dist. Chicago, Illinois 60602-1304
Gih Dis.  GREGG GOSLIN 14th Oist.
ThDist.  TIMOTHY 0. SCHNEIDER 15th Dist. TEL (312) 603-5502
8th Disi.  ANTHONY J. PERAICA 16th Dist. FAX (312) 603-4547

ELIZABETH ANN O00DY GORMAN  17th ist.

July 23, 2009

Ms. Carmen Triche-Colvin

Purchasing Agent

County Building-Room 1018 P
Chicago, Illinois 60602 ~r R

Re: Contract No. 09-84-39 e | ‘ ,‘ ~
(4 JUL 24 Priz Go

Dear Ms, Triche-Colvin:

- The following bid for the above referenced contract has been reviewed for

compliance with the General Conditions regarding the Minority and Women
Owned Business Enterprises Ordinance and has been found to be non-
responsive to the Ordinance:

Bidder: Ready Data, Inc.
Remanufactured Base Bid Amount: $835,093.40

The following bid for the above referenced contract has been reviewed for
compliance with the General Conditions regarding the Minority and Woman
Business Enterprises Ordinance and has been found to be responsive to the
Ordinance. R —

Bidder: Tallgrass Systems, Ltd. ,
Remanufactured Base Bid Amount: $854,516.50

M/WBE Status Dollar Amount %
JJC Group, Inc. MBE-9 $213,629.13(I) 25%
Computer Products &

Supplies International, Inc. WBE-6 $ 85,451.65(I) 10%

The Office of Contract Compliance has been advised by the requesting
department that no other bidders are being recommended for award.

Sincerely,

bt Howesek /wy "

Betty Hancock Perry
Contract Compliance Administrator

BHP/hrtj
Cc: Cook County Health and Hospital System

@ Printed on Reeyeled Paper
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TABULATION OF BIDS

CONTRACT NO.: 09-84-39

~ OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
COUNTY OF COOK

CARTRIDGES, TONER, LEXMARK

FOR

COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

REQUISITION NO. #9890001 [

BID OPENING DATE: 05/07/09

BIDDER: A&A ILLINOIS BEBON OFFICE | READY DATA, TALLGRASS
OFFICE BUSINESS MACHINES INC. SYSTEMS, LTD
MACHINES SYSTEMS
SERVICE,
INC.
NON- ¥ ,
REMANUFACTURED $1,479,118.85 $150,721.71
BASE BID: NO BID NO BID NO BID
REMANUFACTURED L *
BASE BID:
$458,992.00 $567,979.47 $530,718.24 $$835,093.40 $854,516.50

RIDDER: RIBBONS RASIX DISCOVER FLEET USA, | JSA,LP D/B/A/ 1™

EXPRESS COMPUTER GROUP, INC. INC. SOURCE AMERICA

£
INC. CENTER, INC.
D/B/A/
ACADEMIC
SUPPLIER
NON-
REMANUFACTURED $1,919,353.29 $1,983,3751.12
BASE BID: $1,550,594.00 $1,582,331.00 $1,702,118.30
REMANUFACTURED
SE BID:

BA D $1,297,797.00 $950,570.62 NO BID $876,270.27 $424,553.00
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,'TF‘ABULATION OF BIDS OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

COUNTY OF COOK

CARTRIDGES, TONER, LEXMARK
FOR
COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

CONTRACT NO.: 09-84-39 BID OPENING DATE: 05/07/09
REQUISITION NO. #98900011

BIDDER: TOSHIBA CARTRIDGE NEXT DAY
BUSINESS TECHNOLOGIES TONER
SOLUTIONS-IL (REINK SUPPLIES,
TECHOLOGIES, INC.
INC.)

NON-

REMANUFACTURED A

BASE BID: $2,026,543.95 $2,048,082.67 $2,127,700.08

REMANUFACTURED

BASE BID: '
$691,649.75 $739,726.02 $749,101.20

EST: §780,000.00 4 BAF: 02-04-09

FIGURE NOT READ ALOUD

NOTE:

NOTE:

NOTE:

NOTE:

NOTE:

NOTE:

THE FIGURE READ ALOUD AT THE BID OPENING FOR: RASIX COMPUTER CENTER, INC. D/B/A/ ACADEMIC
SUPPLIER, REMANUFACTURED BASE BID, WAS: $950,570.59. A REVIEW OF THE ARITHMETIC AND
EXTENSIONS OF UNIT PRICES REFLECTS A BID OF: $950,570.62.

THE FIGURE READ ALOUD AT THE BID OPENING FOR: FLEET USA, INC. NON-REMANUFACTURED
BASE BID WAS: $1,919,353.20. A REVIEW OF THE ARITHMETIC AND EXTENSIONS OF UNIT PRICES
REFLECTS A BID OF: $1,919,353.29.

THE FIGURE READ ALOUD AT THE BID OPENING FOR: JSA, LP D/B/A/ 1°T SOURCE AMERICA
NON-REMANUFACTURED BASE BID WAS: $1,983,359.25. A REVIEW OF THE ARITHMETIC AND
EXTENSIONS OF UNIT PRICES REFLECTS A BID OF: $1,983,375.12.

THE FIGURE READ ALOUD AT THE BID OPENING FOR: TOSHIBA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS-IL,
REMANUFACTURED BASE BID WAS: $648,949.75. A REVIEW OF THE ARITHMETIC AND
EXTENSIONS OF UNIT PRICES REFLECTS A BID OF: $691,649.75.

THE FIGURE READ ALOUD AT THE BID OPENING FOR: TOSHIBA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS-IL,
NON-REMANUFACTURED BASE BID WAS: $2,026,543.90. A REVIEW OF THE ARITHMETIC AND
EXTENSIONS OF UNIT PRICES REFLECTS A BID OF: $2,026,543.95.

THE FIGURE READ ALOUD AT THE BID OPENING FOR: NEXT DAY TONER SUPPLIES, INC.,
NON-REMANUFACTURED BASE BID WAS: $2,127,699.70. A REVIEW OF THE ARITHMETIC
AND EXTENSIONS OF UNIT PRICES REFLECTS A BID OF: $2,127,700.08.

2.2 . L
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COOK COUNTY HEALTH AND HOSPITALS SYSTEM

Award & Execute
Date: September 2, 2009
Sponsor: Johnny C. Brown

Chief Operating Officer

Operating Unit: John H. Stroger, Jr. Hospital of Cook County

Description of: Corporate Cleaning Services (Chicago, IL 60610) for the
Services: provision of Window Washing Services.

Justification for We have reviewed the bid tabulations for contract 08-53-393 and
This Contract: recommend award to the lowest qualified bidder meeting the

specifications, Corporate Cleaning Services.

Cost of Contract This is a twenty-four (24) month contract in the amount of
And Terms: $133,480.00 to commence upon award, execution and implementation
of the contract.

Budget Info: Budget Acct. No. 8970153

Signatures:

_ Sponsor | \%A/_Z( %'—ﬁ T/\%Lof
X

Request #
20

Operating Unit CFO

CCHHS Director of
Purchasing

CCHHS COO
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‘*ABULATION OF BIDS OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
COUNTY OF COOK

WINDOW WASHING SERVICES
FOR
JOHN H. STROGER, JR. HOSPITAL OF COOK COUNTY

CONTRACT NO: 08-53-393 BID OPENING DATE: 03/24/09
REQUISITION NO: 88970561

KC/12228 } !

CORPORATE AMERICAN DUST EM CLEAN PROGRAM
CLEANING NATIONAL SKYLINE,| MAINTENANCE MAINTENANCE, INC.
SERVICES INC. OF CHICAGO | d/bla SERVICE ONE,
. INC.

BASE BID: $133,480.00 $135,792.00 $149,364.00 410,520.00
ANCHOR
BUILDING
SERVICES

BASE BID: $610,800.00

EST. $ AMOUNT: $200,000.00

L8 B

Page 37 of 44






THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

4 L4 ‘
- ’ M
EARLEAN COLLINS
ROBEK STEELE
JERRY BYTLER
WILLIAM M. BEAVERS
DEBORAH SIMS
JOAN PATRICIA MURPHY
JOSEPH MARIO MORENO
ROBERTO MALDONADO

TODD H. STROGER
PRESIDENT

1st Dist. PETER N. SILVESTR!
2nd Dist, BRIDGET GAINER

3rd Dist. JOHN P. DALEY

4th Dist. FORREST CLAYPOOL
5th Dist. LARRY SUFFREDIN

6th Dist. GREGG GOSLIN

7th Dist. TIMOTHY 0. SCHNEIDER
8th Dist. ANTHONY J. PERAICA

June 12, 2009

Ms. Carmen Triche-Colvin

Purchasing Agent

9th Dist.
10th Qist.
11th Dist.
12th Dist.
13th Dist.
14th Dist.
151h Dist.
16th Dist.
ELIZABETH ANN DOODY GORMAN  17ih Dist.

COOK COUNTY
OFFICE OF CONTRACT COMPLIANCE

BETTY HANCOCK PERRY
DIRECTOR

118 North Clark Street, Room 1020
Chicago, Illinois 60602-1304
TEL (312) 603-5502
FAX (312) 603-4547

09 JUK IS5 PH bL: 53

County Building-Room 1018
Chicago, Illinois 60602

Re: 08-53-393

Dear Ms. Triche-Colvin:
The following bids for the above referenced contract have been reviewed for

compliance with the General Conditions regarding the Minority and Woman
Business Enterprises Ordinance and have been found to be responsive to the

Ordinance.

Bidder: Corporate Cleaning Services
Base Bid Amount: $133,480.00

M/WBE Status Dollar Amount %
We're Cleaning Inc. MBE (7) $33,370.00 (D) 25%
Discovery Promotions & Merchandising WBE (6) $13,348.00 (I) 10%

The Office of Contract Compliance has been advised by the requesting.
department that no other bidders are being recommended for award.

Sincerely,

Betty'Hancock Perry ‘
Contract Compliance Administrator

BHP/lar

cc: John H. Stroger, Jr. Hospital of Cook County

@ Printed on Recycled Paper
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Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Request to Award Bid, Enter Into and Execute Contract

Date: September 15, 2009
Sponseor: Leslie Duffy, R.N., M.B.A.

Senior Director, Supply Chain Management

Operating Unit: Cook County Health and Hospital System

Description of
Service: Requesting approval to award and execute Contract 09-45-225 to

Consumers Packing Company, Melrose Park, IL for Seafood
Products for John H. Stroger, Jr. Hospital (Section I) and
Oak Forest Hospital (Section II) of Cook County.

Justification for
this Centract: A request for bid proposals was initiated and evaluated by the user

department. Consumer Packing Company was chosen by virtue of
them being the lowest bidder meeting all specifications and
meeting MBE/WBE ordinance requirements.

Cost of the Contract
and Terms: This is a one year contract to commence immediately upon

execution and implementation of the contract.

Budget Information: Fiscal Impact: 897 /310 — Section I, $89,225.00
898/ 310 — Section II, $32,087.50

Signatures:
CCHHS CFO :
CCHHS Director W m@ /M
of Purchasing |

ﬁAQ‘ Request #
CCHHS COO ‘ 21

7
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SEA FOOD PRODUCTS

FOR
.._OIZ H. STROGER JR HOSPITAL
TABULATION OF BIDS * OAK FOREST HOSPITAL
Contract No.: 09-45-225 CENTRALIZED HOSPITAL PURCHASING
COOK COUNTY
Requisition No:98970071;98980135 B. O. Date: 08/12/2009
BIDDER
CONSUMER BADGER FINER
PACKING ¢o] MURPHY | FOODS INC.
SECTION| |>¥
BASE BID $89,225.00 $100,307.50 | $103,381.50
SECTIONIl 3 ) 087,50 $30,503.60 | $39,782.70
BASE BID 081 993, ,[82.
ALTERNATE 4
SEGTION | $88,705.00 $94,307.50
ALTERNATE
SECTION I $31,089.10 $35,024.00
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THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

EARLEAN COLLINS
RORERT STEELE

JERRY BUTLER
WILLIAM M. BEAVERS
DEBORAH SIMS

JOAN PATRICIA MURPHY
JOSEPH MARIO MORENO
ROBERTO MALDONADO

COOK COUNTY

TODD H. STROGER OFFICE OF CONTRACT COMPLIANCE

PRESIDENT

BETTY HANCOCK PERRY
st Dist.  PETER N. SILVESTRI Sth Dist. DIRECTOR i
2nd @ist.  BRIDGET GAINER 10th Dist.
3rd Wist.  JOHN P. DALEY 111h Dist.
A ERSt  FORREST CLAYPOOL 12t Dist. 118 North Clark Street, Room 1020
5th.@ist.  LARRY SUFFREDIN 13th Dist. Chicago, Illinois 60602-1304
Gth Mist.  GREGG GOSLIN 1410 Dist.
7th.mt.  TIMOTHY 0. SCHNEIDER 15th Dist TEL (312) 603-5502

BihEWst.  ANTHONY J. PERAICA 161 Dist. FAX (312) 603-4547
ELIZABETH ANN DODDY GORMAN 171h Dist.

September 11, 2009

Ms. Leslie Duffy

Semnior Director

Supply Chain Management

1900 West Polk Street, Suite 220
Chicago, IL 60612

Re: Contract No. 09-45-225

The following bid for the above referenced contract has been reviewed for
compliance with the General Conditions regarding the Minority and Women
Owyned Business Enterprises Ordinance and has been found to be non-
responsive to the Ordinance:

Bidder: Badger Murphy
Section II Base Bid Amount: $30,593.60

The following bid for the above referenced contract has been reviewed for
compliance with the General Conditions regarding the Minority and Woman
Business Enterprises Ordinance and has been found to be responsive to the
Ordinance.

Bidder: Consumer Packing Company
Section I Base Bid Amount: $89,225.00
Section II Base Bid Amount: $32,087.50

=3

M/WBE Status Dollar Amount

Sun Business Solutions MBE-8 $30,328.13(1) 25%2 ;“%
Clark Catering WBE-6 $12,131.25(1) 1O°/oc‘=4:

@
The Office of Contract Compliance has been advised by the requesting f
department that no other bidders are being recommended for award. w

=

=

™y

(&3]

BHP/hrtj

Ccz Cook County Health and Hospital System

@ Printed on Recycled Paper
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Cook County Health and Hospitals System
Finance Committee
Contract Item for Board Approval,
Request to Award Bid, and Request to Enter Into and Execute Contract

Sponsor: Leslie Dufty, Director of Procurement, CCHHS

Operating Unit: Cook County Health and Hospitals System

Description of Service:

Authorization is requested to enter into contract with the following lowest qualified
bidders meeting specifications for the provision of Disposable Dietary Supplies. Contract
" Number 09-15-016H1.

Justification for this contract:*

The following vendors are the lowest qualified bidders meeting specifications, and were
found to be responsive to the Minority and Women Owned Business Enterprises
Ordinance as determined by the Contract Compliance Administrator:

s Atlas & Associates: ltems 4, 6, 8 and 9.

¢ Inlander Brothers, Inc.: Item 1.

¢ Progressive Industries, Inc.: Items 2, 3, 5, 7 and 10.
Cost of the contract and terms:

This is a 6 month contract to commence upon Board Award and end on February 28,
2010. The total anticipated cost of this contract is $ 108,575.15.

Atlas & Associates $ 2,648.74
Inlander Brothers, Inc. $ 45,482.50
Progressive Industries, Inc. ‘ $ 60,443.91

Total $ 108,575.15

Budget information: The cost for this contract has been committed for the current
operating budget of 2009 and future year funds for Miscellaneous Dietary Supplies
240/891/897/898-335.

* Contained in the backup materials are justifications to award bids, and
request to enter into and execute contracts.

Request #
22
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Signatures:

~

\
uffy, Director of Proclirgiaégt, CCHHS
CCHHS CFO el oL

Pitt Calkin, Interim Chief Financial Officer, CCHHS

CCHHS COO 7@ B. 1201 H-"Tony Tedesch

David R. Small, F.A.C.H.E., CAO, CCHHS

Sponsor
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The following bidder did not meet specifications. Justification provided:

The apparent lowest bidder did not meet specifications for the following item therefore
request award to Progressive Industries, Inc.

¢ ltem 3: Inter-City Supply Company, Inc. failed to provide samples as specified.
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